
Bribie Tigers 2020 Registration 

 

How to register in 2020 

Registering as a Bribie Tigers player for the 2020 season needs to be done via PlayFootball, an online 
system run by Football Federation Australia. 

To access the system go to the following link - 
https://registration.playfootball.com.au/common/pages/reg/welcomeregplus.aspx?entityid=31146
&id=73764 

From there you can register using your previous log on details (if you have played previously) or by 
creating an account. 

Payment Options 

2020 registration fees can be found on the Club website 
http://websites.sportstg.com/club_info.cgi?c=1-9393-138044-0-0&sID=389717 

$5 of the registration fee includes a Club membership fee.  This is payable per family.  Second and 
subsequent players registering from the same family can request this element of their registration fee 
be refunded, or it would be gratefully received as a donation to support the development of the Club.  
Please e-mail Stuart Cooper, Club Treasurer treasurer@bribieislandfc.com.au stating your preference 
in such circumstances. 

There are two ways of paying your registration fees for 2020. 

Preferred method – Pay full fees at the time of registration 

The Club’s preferred payment method is for players to pay via PlayFootball, which can be done at the 
time of registration.   

By paying via this method your affiliation fees are deducted automatically, with the Club only receiving 
it’s proportion of your fee, which reduces administration.  It also ensures that Club has access to your 
Club fees from early on in the season meaning we have sufficient funds to cover the cost of running 
the Club. 

Direct Debit 

Registration fees are due at the time of registration. 

The Club does recognise however that some player families get benefit from being able to pay the 
registration fees in a staged way rather than by way of a single payment.  For this reason the Club does 
offer the opportunity to pay some fees by direct debit.  Paying via direct debit is arranged for you by 
the Club via an organisation known as Pay Advantage.  Pay Advantage do charge you a small fee to 
use their service per transaction.  They will also charge you a fee each time a direct debit payment is 
rejected by your bank.  The payment of all charges is the responsibility of the player. 



Details of Pay Advantage fees can be found here https://www.payadvantage.com.au/pricing/ 

For 2020 the Club is offering players the opportunity to pay the Club only proportion of fees split over 
8 weeks.  Affiliation fees however need to be paid up front via bank transfer into the Club’s bank 
account. 

If you would like to pay by direct debit, at the time of registration in PlayFootball, opt to make an 
offline payment.  Please then e-mail Stuart Cooper, Club Treasurer who will send you the relevant 
information and form to complete - treasurer@bribieislandfc.com.au 

The offer to pay via direct debit is at the sole discretion of the Club committee.  Where a player has 
defaulted on direct debits in previous years, the committee reserve the right not to extend this 
payment option again. Where two direct debit payments fail then a player’s registration will be 
cancelled and they will not be able to continue playing for the Club from that time onwards.  No refund 
of fees paid will routinely be made unless an application for exceptional circumstances is made in line 
with the Club’s refund policy. 

Other Payment Options 

If you wish to pay your full registration fees up front but are unable to make an on line payment via 
PlayFootball then please contact to Stuart Cooper, Club Treasurer to discuss other options – 
treasurer@bribieislandfc.com.au 

Fair Play Vouchers 

The Club is registered to accept Fair Play vouchers which can assist eligible families with the 
registration costs.  They are only accepted against registration fees, cannot be exchanged for cash and 
are not refundable in the case of a cancelled registration. 

Information about Fair Play Vouchers are available here 
https://www.qld.gov.au/recreation/sports/funding/fairplay/apply 

If you wish to pay part of your fees by this method please select to pay off line when registering in 
PlayFootball and e-mail Stuart Cooper, Club Treasurer – treasurer@bribieislandfc.com.au 

Refund Policy 

Refunds of registration fees once paid cannot routinely be offered and are available only in very 
exceptional circumstances. 

The Club registration and refund policy can be found here 
http://websites.sportstg.com/get_file.cgi?id=36589335 

 
Stuart Cooper 
Club Treasurer 
On behalf of the 2020 Committee 
 


